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FINANCE OFFICER/ REGISTRAR \rru
VTU CAMPUS -~

MACHHE

BELGAUM

590018
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+§iob-‘nal: 20,83,40,331.50Cr
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Currlncy INR .
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8/25/2020 - Gmail - Explanation to Delay in Submission of Invoices to BIOCON Foundation

o’

VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmail.com>

Explanatlon to Delay in Submission of Invoices to BIOCON Foundatron
3 messages

VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmail.com> | | : Mon, Aug 24, 2020 at 2:21 PM
To: Balavant Patil <bekayp72@gmail.com>

7o

Mr Balavant Patil
Chief Technical Officer
VTU-NASD Dandel

Respected Sir,

with reference to mail subject, kindly provide with neoessary details of commumcatlons of yours with BIOCON
Foundation regarding submission of Invoices towards expendlture incurred in setting up of Computer Lab and
Digital Library facility at VTU- NASD Dandeli through CSR Support from BIOCON Foundation as you were
representtng VTU-NASD Dandeli .

Thank You

Regards

Vishal Kulkarni

Director ‘ %’

Visvesvaraya Technological University s
REGIS

Natso__nr':}l Academy for Skill Development Jemarye = sarnological University
Dandeli BELACA\H :
www.nasd.org.in : : £

mtps:.flmaii.google.comfmaiquD?ik=d7b9f3beaa&view=pt&search=ali&permlhid=thread-a%3Ar-73560?847269287655&simpl=msg-a%?&Ar-?aosss301214307335&simpi=msg-f%3A1 675929898135218442&simpl=ms... 1



8/25/2020 _.Gmail - Explanation to Delay in Submission of Invoices to BiOCON Foundation

Balavant Patil <bekayp72@gma:i com>" J Tue, Aug 25, 2020 at 10:04 AM
To: VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmail.com> ' :

~ Respected Sir,

Received your mail asking for communications held with BIOCON Foundatlon on submission of Invoices towards
expenditure incurred in setting up of Digital Library and Computer Lab. We were in contact with Mrs. Pratima Rao,
Director Biocon Foundation till the procurement of Desktop computers Madam has senta maﬂ and made a
request to us to be in touch with Mr. Prabhjot for further communications. Hence we were in contact with Mr.
Prabhjot. When we had a communication with Mr. F’rabhjot e rer the phon regardlng submnssnons the mvonces in
a stage manner as and when procurement compietes He clearly said that he had been instructed by Madan

ratima F submit all the ‘ time whlch wnII make |t easy for them to take the necessary approval

Sir, Iwould Ilke to bring to your klnd notice that we have receiv e detailed documents from Easylib'company
UnNei2020. As soon as we received details from easyhb c:ompany we |n1t1ated the request on 20th June
2020 ltself by sending an email and hard copy of documents are sent through speed post.

These are all the communications held Wlth the BIOCON Foundation. | have also attached the email copy of
Madam Pratima Rao who has directed us to be in touch with Mr Prabhijot for your kind reference.

Thanks & regards, ;
Balavant Patil _ o

‘ 0 e REGISTRAR .
On Mon, Aug 24, 2020 at 2:20 PM VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmail.com> wrote:  ssyesvaraya Technciogical University
[Quoted text hidden] "BELAGAVE

@ BIOCON Prabjot docx - _
16K | i

https-//mail.google.com/mailfu/0?ik=d7b9f3beaadview=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar-735607847269287655&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-74056530121 4307335&simpl=msg-f°fn3ﬁgl 675929898135218442&simpl=ms...
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Dear Sir; : e :

As per instructions received bv our Director(l[c) Dr. Sreenivas CG, please find the trallmg maii sent by
“Mrs: Pratima Rao, Mission Director, Biocon Foundation, in this'mail thev have cleariy stated that

procurement has to be done by us and on presentation of invoice they will release the payment. Also

please find the attached files of vendor details and quotations sent by Biocon with the same.

This is for your kind information and neceéssary action.
Thanks & regards,

BalaVant patil.

From! [atima Rao@biocon. com [mailto:Pratima. Rao@biocon com]
Sent: Thursday, August 9, 2018 4:15 PM '
To: Balavant Patil

Cct Prakash L. Prabhu, reenivasacg@gma!l com; u dayrrayargddi@gmall com;
Prabhjot Sran@biocon.com; madan. pl0l@biocon.com
uhiect VTU/NASD Furniture Electrica! and Networklng

Dear Balavant,
PFA the Lab-Library dr_aw‘in"gs and associated quotation from Vendor as below.

U&S Fifth-Wall Designs LLP:- RS e,
#3309, ,Ground Floor,8th Cross, 12th Main HAL 2nd Stage
Indira Nagar,Bangalore- Karnataka - 560 038

Please arrange to place the order directly on the vendor by VTU NASD. On presentation of the
invoice, we will release the payment to VTU NASD to make the payment to the vendor.

This procedure' is:to be maintained for the Library Software easylib as well.

We have already placed the order for 40 computer systems, 1 projector and 1 prmter These
will be sourced directly by us.

ohjot anidMadanin thisiregardy

Thanks and regards,

Pratima Rao

Mission Director
Biocon Foundation
www.bioconfoundation.org

untlnhrﬂ-.-“:






From: VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmail.com>

~ Sent:Tuesday, 07 July, 20202:28PM _

To: Pratima Rao/Biocon Foundation/BIOCON <Pratima. Rao@blocon coms>

' Cc. Vrdmtrust@dmail corn; Vishal Kulkarni <wshal49@gmall ¢oms; raghunath 94?@yahoo com; Balavant Panl
<balavant.patil@aequs.com>; sap@viu.ac.in; Sanjeev Nlngombam <sanjeevnbm@9mali comz; ve@vtu.aciin;
Registrar, VTU Belagavi <registrar@vtu ac.in>

Subject: Re: Forwarding scanned copies of Invoices.

Respected Pratima Madam
Greetings from VTU- NASD Dandeli

we extend our sincere thanks for.your reply.. We understand the difficult phase of what the country. is now undergomg and
we respect your support to the nation by.standing firm with otr people through your CSR activities. Mam we feel really
thankful to be associated with BIOCON Foundation for: being with us In establishing Digital Library and Computer Lab which
is best used for providing skill developmenit lraining to most. needy aspirants. Last'year with the use of this facility. we were
able to train 400 plus stuidents (including GNC: trade) at VTU-NASD Dandeli. the institute (s developing under your kind
support and guidance with an objective to provide!best learning platforms for.eVery asplrant. We could do all this' because of
your facility suppon of computers at our center Currenl]y & trades are in function and 1 trade is in process of setup.

on-going tr_ades '

1) CI_\IC' Op_efétlons and Pro’gra.mining '

2) Automotive painting

3) Accounts Executive

4) Data Entry operations

.5) Computer.Hardware and Networking.. ... .

6) Basic and Industrial Electricals (process of selup).

Out of 5 angong trades | 3 are.best using yolur' fac;ilitiés.-Using this facility. we:do offer internship courses like
1) Internet of Things (loT) for BE 'Studenls e '

2) Advanced Excel and Tally erp 9.0 with GS“:rv-fo'r B.Com éiu'déﬂts’

3) Basics of computers for B.A, PUC and even Schcol étddents from nearby government schools,

The library software (easy Ilb) has reaily helped us to provide e-resources to students for their advanced understanding on
the selected trades.

Mam about your query on :

Feasibility of such advanced software for basic level of instruction was still under discussion at that time and we were
not aware of the final financial requirement.

As per trailing mail communications attached along with this mail, Mam it was on Tuesday, June 26, 2018 2:35 PM you had
directed through your mail to us to negotiate with easy lib over the amount so that it can be better utilised by you for
purchase of printer, projector and screen. ‘As per your directions and trailing mail sent on'Wednesday, June 27, 2018
12:42 , a negotiation (orally) was done and a request to Mr Vasu, Easylib was made to reach out to you with the quotes

for final negotiation and approval from your end. After this conversation, the procurement process began and we thought
the final negotiated amount was done by Biocon Foundation , hence we adhered to the quote submitted.

Madam, we will be ever thankful to you for your continued support in this journey of Skill development and Livelihood
creation among needy aspirants. We request you to kindly.reeonsider our invoices {0\5 part payments release at least (in 2 to

A3 wete
A0 Toaet !
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3 step payments) so that we can use up the received amount for creating more opponunltles of Iearning as most of tha
people are now badly in need of- sklil development training and ‘placement support due to. COVID-19 pandemic sltuatlon

Lbo'kli:ng fqrwa_rd to.your continued support and guidance as always.

Thanking you

Mr Balavant Patil

Chief Technical Officer
VTU-NASD Dandeli

On Wed, Jun 24, 2020 at 11:48 AM Pratima,Rao@biocon.com <Pratima.Rao@biocon.com> wrote:

| Dear Mr Patil,

Hope you are doing well,

- We have recelved the hard coples df-the Involces. if we had received the invoices before 1% April 2020, we would
- have taken Board approval and included it in the budget of FY20-21.

| We have already complied with the supply of computefs projector-and printer in'FY18-19 as per commitment.
| Feasibility of such advanced software for basiclevel of instruction was still under discussion at that time and we were
I not aware of the final financial requirement:

As all budgets are pre-approved and large amounts have_been allotted to _CO\!ID-]Q activities including distribution of

 food kits and the setting up of a COVID:19 test centre, it-will be difficult for us to consider the funding at this time.

Best wishes,

Pratima Rao

{ From: vtu nasd <vtunasd@gmail.com>

i Sent: Saturday, 20 June, 2020 4:14 PM

| To: Pratima Rao/Biocon Foundation/BIOCON <Pratima.Rao@biocon.com>

i CerVrdmtrust@gmail.com; Vishal Kulkarni <vishal49@gmail.com>; raghunath1947@yahoo com;. Balavant Patil

| <balavant.patil@aequs.com> ol®\
| Subject: Forwarding scanned copies of Invoices. 3‘(‘;\?{;\0@ \)“N
0o
1Q,CK\P‘GPN\.
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Respected Madam,
Greetings from VTU-NASD, Dandelill 4

Trust that you and your team are safe and healthy!!!

Once again we extend cur sincers thanks for your donation of the Computer lab.and Digital library facility to our institute
under.your CSR. The layout of the lab and projection area are perfectly fitin the place. As a part of the Computer lab set-
up and Digital library, you have sent us the Desktop computers, LCD projector.and a Printer. You had asked us to procure
the planned furniture and Digital Library software and upon the: submission of the invoice reimbursement will be done by
BIOCON. In this regard herewith | am sending scanned copies of both the invoices with our Bank details foryour

kind perusal. Hard copy of the same has been dispatched through speed post already.

'Please do the needful.

Thanks & regards,

‘Balavant.Patil

i Chief:Technical Officer,

Visvesvaraya Technological University

i

National Academy for Skill Development
Dandeli, l
9844590444

www.nasd.org.In

Pratima Rao :
| MISSION DIRECTOR - BIOCON FOUNDATION

i Blocon Limlted | 20th KM, Hosur.Road, Elestronic Gity, Banga!ora 560100, india

Et Pratima.Rao@hlocnn .com | T: +91 80 2808 2808
w: www.biucon com

$ Biocon Rnnlmd Among (TT,

Global Top Ten il
Biotech Employers: 2018 PRI
The Only’ Asian Company to Feature

| --m“n\m

i Confidential and Privileged :
i This message is for the designated recipient only and may contain privileged, proprietary, or otherwise private infarmation. If you have received it
in error, please notify the sender.immediately and delete the original, Any other use of the e-mail by you is prohibited. Opinions, conclusions and
| other information in this transmission that does not relate to the official business of this Company shall be understood as personal and not
endorsed by the company, Any statements made herein that are tantamount to contractual ebligations, promises, claims or commitments shall not
be binding on the Company unless followed by written confirmation by an authorized signatory of the Company
Please consider the environment before printing this email




Visvesvaraya Technological University
~ National Academy for Skill Development
Dandel

www.nasd.org.in

PratimaRao
MISSION DIRECTOR - BIOCON FOUNDATION

Biocon Limlted | 20th KM, Hosur Road, Electronic City, Bangalore - 860100, India

E: Mm&g@_mgu_m | T: +91 80 2808 2808
Wi wwwblocm com

This messaga |s for the deslgna reclplent on!y and ma tain priviléged, proprietary; or otherwise private information. If you have received it in error,
pleasé notify, thé sender Immediately and delete the' original. ‘Any.other use of the e-mail by you is prohibited. Opinlons, conclusions and other infarmation in
this tr I .that does not relate to the officlal business of: this Company shall be understoqd as personal and not endorsed by the campany, Aay
statements méde herein that are tantamount to contractual’ chhgations, promises, cla(ms or commitments shall not be binding on'the Company unless
followed by writtén confirmation by an authorized signatory of the Cornpany

Please :dnslder the envlronment befare prlnllng thfs emall ;

. @ 2. Donatlon Receipt Tempiate docx
14

VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmanl c0m> i s
To:'Pratima. Rao@blocon cqm" <Pratima. Rao@bmcon com> :

Ge: "Vrdmtrust@amail.com” <Vrdmtrust@gmail. com>, Vishal Kulkarm <vnshal49@gmaaf com=; “raghunath1947@yahoo.com”
<raghunath1947@yahoo.com>, Balavant Palil <balavant patil@aequs.com>, "sap@viu.ac.in® <sap@vtu.ac.in>, Sanjeev
Ningombam: <sanjeevnbm@gma:l com=, "vc@vtu ac. in" <vc@vtu ac.In>, "Reagistrar; VTU Belagavi" <registrar@vtu.ac.in>

Mon, Aug 17,2020 at 5:67 PM

Respected Madam 2
Greelmgs from VTU- Nahonal Academy for.Skill Development Dandeh

Atthe oulset we are lhankfu! lo you for conmdering our request and approaching Mazumdar Shaw Philanthropy (MSP) for
.we extend our sincere thanks to' Madam Kiran Mazumdar Shaw for her.concern and support for
us and heipln§ the student community for better learning through BIOCON Sponsored Digital Library and Compuler Lab
facility as VTU:NASD Dandeli.

Madam the overall expenditure incurred for setting up this facility at VIU-NASD is detailed in the table below.

Sl. No. Vendor Name - Description Qty | Invoice No Date Amotunt
1. ; Digital |incar Workstation | 13 No,
2. Ox'altlnl.erlo. (‘omputc.r Lab Lincar 21 No. 2 20-04-2019 | Rs.3,58.920.00

Belagavi Workstation
3. Meeting Table 1 No.
4. Easylib Software Pvt. 1 No. 19-02-2020 | Rs.3,54,000.00

Ltd, Bangalore Easylib 6.2a Web Version EASPL/2020= .;.\\\;

2340 \i’)ﬁ
ool
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e Plastic Chairs (Nilkamal ; v el S
DSP. ! S : 8/0 | Rs43250.00
S P cntures_ CHR3197) .?OND 102 2 9[2019.- Rs4325000
6 B T R o T 29/02/2020 | Rs 3,49,670.00
Solutions, Belagavi & o

Rupees Eleven Lakh five thousand eig_l_:t_ hulfdred forty only _Total = ‘;&%&%%%@93’ :

A

Note: A payment ofRs'3,22,_14'0[-. is_méde td-Easylib software Company and invoice for rehﬁainit_ig"

Rs 31,860/~ bill is alteady received and submitted to the Sales and purchase Department, VTU this
payment will be done after | year completion of installation,

W really appreciate your kind efforts in standing with us for.the society in this critical pandemic situation of COVID 19. We
really understand the contributions and support rendered from BIOCON Foundation to our community to overcome this
crisis from COVID-19 . Requesting your kind consideration of the total expenditure and needful towards processing of -
balance amount in your upcoming financial quarters which ever is feasible to youWe will always be thankful to you for your
continued support and handholding in'skill development activities thereby. nation building. ool :

We will be submitting the required documents soonfor the processing of the above funding amount from Mazumdar Shaw
Philanthropy. (MSP). : e -

Please find attached the invaices of the above expendifure along With this mail

Thanking You
Regards ;
Balavant Patil

~Chief Technical Officer —
Visvesvaraya Technological University -
National Academy for Skill Development
Dandeli.
wwwi.nasd.org.in
[Quoted text hidden]

ay bills and mail communications.pdf
% 3862K

Pratima.Rao@blocon.com <Pratima.Rao@biocon.cﬁm> % - Mon, Aug 17,2020 at 9:40 PM
To: VTU NASD <vtunasd@gmail.com> B _ '
Cc; "Vrdmtrust@gmail.com" <vrdmtrust@gmail.com>, Vishal Kulkarni <vishald9@gmail.com>, “raghunath1947@yahoo.com"”
<raghunath1947@yahoo.com>, Balavant Patil <balavant patil@aequs.com>, "sap@viu.ac.in" <sap@wtu.ac.in>, Sanjeev
Ningombam <sanjesvnbm@gmail.com>, "ve@vtu.ac.in” <ve@vtu.aciin>, "Registrar, VTU Belagavi® <registrar@vtu.ac.in>
Dear Mr Patil,
Due to ouron-going commitments to Covid relief work; we are unable to consider your request for release of further funds.
Regards,
Pratima Rao

Sent from Biocon Secure Mobile Mail Client
{Quotéd text hidden)]




